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ATP/WTA STATEMENT ON ONE-WEEK POSTPONEMENT OF ROLAND-GARROS:  
 
Tennis has required an agile approach to the calendar over the past 12 months in order to manage the 
challenges of the pandemic, and this continues to be the case. The decision to delay the start of Roland-
Garros by one week has been made in the context of recently heightened COVID-19 restrictions in France, 
with the additional time improving the likelihood of enhanced conditions and ability to welcome fans at the 
event.  
    
Both the ATP and WTA are working in consultation with all parties impacted by the postponement to 
optimise the calendar for players, tournaments, and fans, in the lead up to and following Roland-Garros. 
Further updates will be communicated in due course. 
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Media contacts: 
ATP: Simon Higson (simon.higson@atptour.com) 
WTA: Amy Binder (abinder@wtatennis.com)  
 
About The ATP 
As the global governing body of men’s professional tennis, the ATP’s mission is to serve tennis. We 
entertain a billion global fans, showcase the world’s greatest players at the most prestigious tournaments, 
and inspire the next generation of fans and players. From the ATP Cup in Australia, to Europe, the 
Americas and Asia, the stars of the game battle for titles and FedEx ATP Rankings points at ATP Masters 
1000, 500 and 250 events, and Grand Slams. All roads lead towards the Nitto ATP Finals, the prestigious 
season finale held in Turin, Italy. Featuring only the world’s top 8 qualified singles players and doubles 
teams, the tournament also sees the official crowning of the year-end ATP World No. 1, the ultimate 
achievement in tennis. For more information, please visit www.ATPTour.com. 
 
About The WTA 
Founded by Billie Jean King in 1973 on the principle of equal opportunity for women in sports, the WTA is 
the global leader in women’s professional sport with more than 1,650 players representing 84 nations 
competing for a record $180 million in prize money. In 2019, the WTA was watched by a record-breaking 
global audience of 700 million. The 2020 WTA Tour includes 53 events and four Grand Slams, spanning 
across six continents and 28 countries and regions. The season culminates with the Shiseido WTA Finals 
Shenzhen, offering a $14 million total prize purse and honouring the season’s top singles and doubles 
players. Further information on the WTA can be found at wtatennis.com. 
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